Current Contract Information: Paint and Paint Related Items
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Office of State Procurement

Rm. 201 General Administration Building, P.O. Box 41017 ( Olympia, Washington 98504-1017 ( (360) 902-7400

http://www.ga.wa.gov  

Paint and Paint Related Items
	State of Washington: Current Contract Information (CCI)

	Revision Date:
	March 23, 2007

	Effective Date:
	April 1, 2007

	CCI Number:
	04

	Contract #
	15504

	Title:
	Paint and Paint Related Items

	Scope:
	As needed purchase of contract products.  There are some unique aspects to this contract.  In an effort to provide best value decision-making assistance to the state’s customers, the Office of State Procurement conducted a competition to determine the apparent best value for paint item purchases.  The vendor achieving the top score is designated as a “Best Choice” contractor.  For customers seeking alternative choices, other vendors within the competitive range are designated as “Alternate Choice” contractors.  These contractors provide alternate products and services that may be needed by state customers.  In addition, customers seeking environment low VOC or recycled products have the option to purchase these items from this contract.  Recycled Products- see pages 5, 9, 14, and 15.

	GA Procurement
Coordinator:
	Michael Maverick, (360) 902-7430, mmaveri@ga.wa.gov.  ALTERNATE: Reception at (360) 902-7400.

	Supervisory Review:
	

	CCI Purpose:
	Contract Extension:  Contract is extended through 3/31/09 with Alpine Products, Kelly-Moore Paint, Parker Paint, Rodda Paint and Sherwin-Williams Paint.  Update variable data.

	Original Term:
	4/1/05 through 3/31/07

	Extension Term
& Number:
	#1: 4/1/07 through 3/31/09

	Authorized Users:
	All State Agencies, Political Subdivisions of Washington and Oregon State, Qualified Non-profit Corporations, Materials Management Center, Participating Institutions of Higher Education (College and Universities, Community and Technical Colleges).

	Current State
Agency Delegation:
	All Washington State agencies shall purchase on-contract at this time.  Reference the Washington State Purchasing Manual for greater detail.  http://www.ga.wa.gov/PCA/Manual.htm

	Contractor:
	Alpine Products, www.alpinetrafficproducts.com, page 6
Kelly-Moore, www.kellymoore.com, page 7
Parker (best choice), www.parkerpaint.com, page 3
Rodda, www.roddapaint.com, page 9
Sherwin-Williams, www.sherwin-williams.com, page 12  

	Contractor Website:
	See Above

	TIN & Supplier #:
	Alpine Products: 91-1508305 & W1118

Kelly-Moore, 532-54-2893 & W6071
Parker, 91-0640330 & W3787
Rodda, 91-1599296 & W6635
Sherwin-Williams, 34-0526850 & W3894 

	Term Worth:
	$1,330,512.00/2-year term.

	Current Participation:
	MBE, $0                   
	WBE, $0              
	Other, $665,256.00/year
	Exempt, $0

	
	MBE, 0%          
	WBE, 0%             
	Other, 100%                  
	Exempt, 0%

	

	Order Placement /
Payment Address:
	See Individual Contract below.

	Purchase Cards:
	See Individual Contract below.

	Minimum Orders:
	None- This contract is not subject to a minimum purchase rule.

	Deposits:
	None- This contract is not subject to a deposit rule.

	Delivery Time:
	See Individual Contract below.

	Payment Terms:
	See Individual Contract below.

	Shipping Terms:
	FOB Destination, Freight Prepaid and Included (subject to freight rule).

	Freight Terms:
	Under $500- Freight Added.  $500 (or more) Prepaid and Included.

	Contract Pricing:
	See Price Sheet Below.

	Technical Specs
	See Technical Specifications Below.

	Important Contract Terms (Excerpted):
	See Excerpted Terms Below.


PRICE SHEETS: 
	Best Choice Contractor: Parker Paint Mfg Co., Inc

Contact: Rankin Jays

Phone: (253) 471-4607

Fax: (253) 473-0448

Email: rjays@parkerpaint.com
Payment Address: 3003 S. Tacoma Way, Tacoma, WA 98409

Order Address: 3003 S. Tacoma Way, Tacoma, WA 98409

Freight Terms: Under $500- Freight Added.  $500 (or more) Prepaid and Included.
Shipping Terms: FOB Destination

Minimum Orders: NONE but see Excerpted Terms below.

Credit Care: Yes, Accepted.

Delivery: Two calendar days after receipt of order (ARO)

Payment Terms: 0% 30 days

	Key: EW: Exterior, Water Based, ES: Exterior, Solvent Based, IW: Interior, Water Based, IS: Interior, Solvent Based, MS: Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, AS: Aerosol, RW: Reprocessed Paint, Water Based, S: Supplies

	Codes
	Description
	Unit
	 Unit Price 
	Discount %
	 Total Price 

	8010
	(1) Exterior, Water Based, Type EW-1 thru EW-5
Mfg: Parker Paint
Brand/Model: Parker Paint

	 EW-1
	# 3150 Flextron 100
	gal
	$22.21 
	45.75%
	$12.05 

	 EW-2
	# 300 Flex Glow 
	gal
	$26.13 
	45.75%
	$14.18 

	 EW-3
	# 3250 Hi Glow
	gal
	$28.74 
	45.75%
	$15.59 

	 EW-4
	# 300 Flex Glow
	gal
	$26.13 
	45.75%
	$14.17 

	 EW-5
	# 3250 Hi Glow
	gal
	$28.74 
	45.75%
	$5.59 

	8010
	(2) Exterior, Solvent Based, Type ES-6 thru ES-8
Mfg: Parker Paint
Brand/Model: Parker Paint

	 ES-6
	# 9185 Prime Gard
	gal
	$17.34 
	45.75%
	$9.41 

	 ES-7
	# 4150 Pro Hide
	gal
	$21.18 
	45.75%
	$11.49 

	 ES-8
	# 4250 Park Avenue 
	gal
	$27.31 
	45.75%
	$14.81 

	8010
	(3) Interior, Water Based, Type IW-1 thru IW-10
Mfg: Parker Paint
Brand/Model: Parker Paint

	 IW-1
	# 4350 Klean Air Flat
	gal
	$23.66 
	45.75%
	$12.83 

	 IW-2
	# 4750 Klean Air Eggshell
	gal
	$23.66 
	45.75%
	$12.83 

	 IW-3
	# 5950 Klean Air Semi Gloss
	gal
	$23.66 
	45.75%
	$12.83 

	 IW-4
	# 3250 Hi Glow
	gal
	$28.74 
	45.75%
	$15.59 

	 IW-5
	# 4650 Velva Kolor
	gal
	$20.14 
	45.75%
	$10.92 

	 IW-6
	# 3850 Wall Kolor
	gal
	$21.95 
	45.75%
	$11.91 

	 IW-7
	# 5750 Pro Satin
	gal
	$16.88 
	45.75%
	$9.16 

	 IW-8
	# 4550 Pro Shell
	gal
	$16.88 
	45.75%
	$9.16 

	 IW-9
	# 3650 Wall Kolor
	gal
	$18.58 
	45.75%
	$10.08 

	 IW-10
	# 3850 Pro Sheen
	gal
	$21.95 
	45.75%
	$11.91 

	8010
	(4) Interior, Solvent Based, Type IS-7 thru Type IS-9
Mfg: Parker Paint
Brand/Model: Parker Paint

	 IS-7
	# 4150 Pro Hide
	gal
	$21.18 
	45.75%
	$11.49 

	 IS-8
	# 1500 Park Avenue 
	gal
	$27.31 
	45.75%
	$14.81 

	 IS-9
	# 4250 Park Avenue 
	gal
	$27.31 
	45.75%
	$14.81 


(5) Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, Type MS-1 thru MS-10

Mfg: Various

	Brand/Model: Various
	

	MS-1
	Zinnser Bullseye Shellac
	gal
	$24.85 
	30%
	$17.39 

	MS-2
	Deft Danish Oil
	gal
	$33.57 
	30%
	$23.50 

	MS-3
	Parker Paint # 925 73
	gal
	$17.27 
	30%
	$12.09 

	MS-4
	Parker Paint # 925 71
	gal
	$17.27 
	30%
	$12.09 

	MS-5
	Parker Paint # 925 79
	gal
	$19.66 
	30%
	$13.76 

	MS-6
	Parker Paint # 925 80
	gal
	$19.66 
	30%
	$13.76 

	MS-7
	Parker Paint # 925 75
	gal
	$19.66 
	30%
	$13.76 

	MS-8
	Benite Flat
	gal
	$54.84 
	30%
	$38.38 

	 MS-9
	McCloskey Heirloom Gloss
	gal
	$23.60 
	30%
	$16.52 

	MS-10
	McCloskey Heirloom Semi Gloss
	gal
	$23.60 
	30%
	$16.52 

	8010
	(6) Aerosol, Type AS-1 thru AS-3
Mfg: Seymour
Brand/Model: Seymour

	 AS-1
	 Layout, Marking, Survey Paint
	17 oz
	$5.70 
	30%
	$3.99 

	AS-2
	Stripping Paint
	17 oz
	$7.93 
	30%
	$5.55 

	AS-3
	Field Marking Paint
	17 oz
	$7.93 
	30%
	$5.55 

	8010
	(7) Interior, Reprocessed Paint, Type RW-1 thru RW-2
Mfg: Parker Paint
Brand/Model: Parker Paint subject to availability
Ready mixed colors: No color choice or specification.

	RW-1
	Interior Latex Semi Gloss
	gal
	$5.00 
	Net
	$5.00 

	RW-2
	Interior Latex Flat
	gal
	$5.00 
	Net
	$5.00 

	8010
	(8) Miscellaneous Supplies, Type S-1
	Varied
	Key
Account
	30%
	NET


	Alternate Choice Contractor: Alpine  Products
Contact: Hugh Jacobson / Alt. Skip Harrison
Phone: (800) 591-9466

Fax: (253) 735-6303

Email: hugh@alpinemarkings.com
Payment Address: 550 3rd St. SW, Bldg C., Auburn, WA 98001

Order Address: 550 3rd St. SW, Bldg C., Auburn, WA 98001

Freight Terms: Under $500- Freight Added.  $500 (or more) Prepaid and Included.

Shipping Terms: FOB Destination

Minimum Orders: NONE but see Excerpted Terms below.

Credit Care: Yes, Accepted.

Delivery: One (1) to seven (7) calendar days after receipt of order (ARO)

Payment Terms: 0% 30 days

	Key: EW: Exterior, Water Based, ES: Exterior, Solvent Based, IW: Interior, Water Based, IS: Interior, Solvent Based, MS: Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, AS: Aerosol, RW: Reprocessed Paint, Water Based, S: Supplies

	Codes
	Description
	Unit
	 Unit Price 
	Discount %
	 Total Price 

	8010
	(6) Aerosol, Type AS-1 thru AS-3
Mfg: Seymour
Brand/Model: Seymour

	AS-1
	Street & Utility Marking Paint, Solvent-Based, VOC Compliant

	 AS-1
	20-651  Aluminum
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-952  White
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-953  Precaution Blue
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-954  Red Fluorescent
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-955  Safety Green
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-957  Orange Fluorescent
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-958  Red/Orange Fluorescent
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-970  Alert Orange
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-971  Safety Red
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	 AS-1
	20-978  Utility Yellow
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	AS-1
	20-979  Pink Fluorescent
	Case
	$32.90 
	0%
	$32.90 

	AS-2
	Traffic Striping Paint, Solvent-Based, VOC Compliant

	AS-2
	20-782  White
	Case
	$44.60 
	0%
	$44.60 

	AS-2
	20-783  Black
	Case
	$44.60 
	0%
	$44.60 

	AS-2
	20-786  Yellow
	Case
	$44.60 
	0%
	$44.60 

	AS-2
	20-647  Red Curb
	Case
	$44.60 
	0%
	$44.60 

	AS-2
	20-648  Handicap Blue
	Case
	$44.60 
	0%
	$44.60 

	AS-3
	Athletic Field Marking Paint, VOC Compliant

	AS-3
	Athletic Field Yellow
	Case
	$43.90 
	0%
	$43.90 

	AS-3
	Athletic Field Blue
	Case
	$43.90 
	0%
	$43.90 

	AS-3
	Athletic Field Red
	Case
	$43.90 
	0%
	$43.90 

	AS-3
	Athletic Field White
	Case
	$43.90 
	0%
	$43.90 

	AS-3
	Athletic Field Orange
	Case
	$43.90 
	0%
	$43.90 


	Alternate Choice Contractor: Kelly-Moore Paint Co.
Contact: Tim Sokolik

Phone: (360) 250-7331
Fax: (360) 459-2143
Email: kcummings@kellymoore.com
Payment Address: 3740 Martin Way, Olympia, WA 98506

Order Address: 3740 Martin Way, Olympia, WA 98506

Freight Terms: Under $500- Freight Added.  $500 (or more) Prepaid and Included.

Shipping Terms: FOB Destination

Minimum Orders: NONE but see Excerpted Terms below.

Credit Care: Yes, Accepted.

Delivery: Three (3) calendar days after receipt of order (ARO)

Payment Terms: 1% 30 days

	Key: EW: Exterior, Water Based, ES: Exterior, Solvent Based, IW: Interior, Water Based, IS: Interior, Solvent Based, MS: Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, AS: Aerosol, RW: Reprocessed Paint, Water Based, S: Supplies

	Codes
	Description
	Unit
	Unit Price
	Discount %
	Total Price

	8010
	(1) Exterior, Water Based, Type EW-1 thru EW-5
Mfg: Kelly-Moore
Brand/Model: Kelly-Moore

	EW-1
	#1240 Acry-Shield
	gal
	$29.18
	50.00%
	$14.59

	EW-2
	#1250 Acry-Shield
	gal
	$35.82
	50.00%
	$17.91

	EW-3
	#1260 Acry-Lustre
	gal
	$36.20
	50.00%
	$18.10

	EW-4
	#5785 DTM Acrylic
	gal
	$45.46
	50.00%
	$22.73

	EW-5
	#5780 DTM Acrylic
	gal
	$42.94
	50.00%
	$21.47

	8010
	(2) Exterior, Solvent Based, Type ES-6 thru ES-8
Mfg: Kelly-Moore
Brand/Model: Kelly-Moore

	ES-6
	#247 Acry-Shield
	gal
	$28.96
	50.00%
	$14.48

	ES-7
	#1870 Alkydex
	gal
	$36.22
	50.00%
	$18.11

	ES-8
	#1275 Weather Shield
	gal
	$39.18
	50.00%
	$19.59

	8010
	(3) Interior, Water Based, Type IW-1 thru IW-10
Mfg: Kelly-Moore
Brand/Model: Kelly-Moore

	IW-1
	#1500 Enviro-Cote
	gal
	$24.56
	50.00%
	$12.28

	IW-2
	#1510 Enviro-Cote
	gal
	$28.18
	50.00%
	$14.09

	IW-3
	#263. Enviro-Cote
	gal
	$34.40
	50.00%
	$17.20

	IW-4
	No Bid
	
	
	
	

	IW-5
	#1686 Dura-Poxy
	gal
	$37.32
	50.00%
	$18.66

	IW-6
	#1685 Dura-Poxy
	gal
	$37.40
	50.00%
	$18.70

	IW-7
	#1610 Acry-Plex
	gal
	$28.90
	50.00%
	$14.45

	IW-8
	#1685 Dura-Poxy
	gal
	$37.40
	50.00%
	$18.70

	IW-9
	#550 Acry-Plex
	gal
	$24.56
	50.00%
	$12.28

	IW-10
	#1650 Acry-Plex
	gal
	$34.40
	50.00%
	$17.20

	
	(4) Interior, Solvent Based, Type IS-7 thru Type IS-9
Mfg: Kelly-Moore
Brand/Model: Kelly-Moore

	IS-7
	No Bid
	
	
	
	

	IS-8
	#1600 Kel-cote
	gal
	$37.88
	50.00%
	$18.94

	IS-9
	#1630 Kel-Cote
	gal
	$37.24
	50.00%
	$18.62


(5) Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, Type MS-1 thru MS-10


Mfg: Various

	Brand/Model: Various
	

	MS-1
	Zinsser Clear Shellac
	gal
	$36.60
	30%
	$25.62

	MS-2
	Watco Danish Oil
	gal
	$28.04
	30%
	$19.63

	MS-3
	Kelly-Moore #Q-Lac 2187
	gal
	$25.45
	50%
	$12.73

	MS-4
	Kelly-Moore #Q-Lac 2186
	gal
	$24.26
	50%
	$12.13

	MS-5
	Kelly-Moore #Q-Lac 2602
	gal
	$29.73
	50%
	$14.87

	MS-6
	Kelly-Moore #Q-Lac 2603
	gal
	$28.66
	50%
	$14.33

	MS-7
	Kelly-Moore #Q-Lac 2601
	gal
	$28.66
	50%
	$14.33

	MS-8
	McCloskey #Heirloom 0007
	gal
	$43.19
	30%
	$30.23

	MS-9
	McCloskey #Heirloom 6703
	gal
	$47.47
	30%
	$33.23

	MS-10
	McCloskey #Heirloom 6702
	gal
	$43.19
	30%
	$30.23

	8010
	(6) Aerosol, Type AS-1 thru AS-3
Mfg: Rustoleum
Brand/Model: Rustoleum

	AS-1
	IC Precision Line Inverted Marking Paint
	17 oz
	$11.35
	30%
	$7.95

	AS-2
	IC Inverted Striping Paint
	17 oz
	$11.35
	30%
	$7.95

	AS-3
	IC Athletic Field Inverted Striping Paint
	17 oz
	$11.35
	30%
	$7.95

	8010
	(7) Interior, Reprocessed Paint, Type RW-1 thru RW-2
Mfg: Kelly-Moore
Brand/Model: Kelly-Moore

	RW-1
	#850 Ecoat (semi gloss)
	gal
	$13.50
	50%
	$6.75

	RW-2
	#840 Ecoat (flat)
	gal
	$11.30
	50%
	$5.65

	8010
	(8) Miscellaneous Supplies, Type S-1
	Varied
	Key
Account
	
	


	Alternate Contractor: Rodda Paint Co., Inc

Contact: Brent Warner

Phone: (360) 459-0006

Fax: (360) 459-0006

Email: bwarner@roddapaint.com
Payment Address: P.O. Box 5127, Portland, OR 97208-5127

Order Address: 4520 Lacey Blvd. SE, Lacey, WA 98503

Freight Terms: Under $500- Freight Added.  $500 (or more) Prepaid and Included.

Shipping Terms: FOB Destination

Minimum Orders: NONE but see Excerpted Terms below.

Credit Care: Yes, Accepted.

Delivery: Seven (7) calendar days after receipt of order (ARO)

Payment Terms: 0% 30 days

	Key: EW: Exterior, Water Based, ES: Exterior, Solvent Based, IW: Interior, Water Based, IS: Interior, Solvent Based, MS: Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, AS: Aerosol, RW: Reprocessed Paint, Water Based, S: Supplies

	Codes
	Description
	Unit
	 Unit Price 
	Discount %
	 Total Price 

	8010
	(1) Exterior, Water Based, Type EW-1 thru EW-5
Mfg: Rodda Paint
Brand/Model: Rodda Paint

	 EW-1
	#511101X AC-911 Exterior Flat Latex
	gal
	$19.99 
	40.00%
	$11.99

	 EW-2
	# 542001X Unique II Semi-Gloss Latex
	gal
	$22.49 
	40.00%
	$13.49

	 EW-3
	# 552001X Unique II Gloss Latex
	gal
	$23.49 
	40.00%
	$14.39

	 EW-4
	# 706230X Ecologic W/B Semi-Gloss 
	gal
	$41.73 
	40.00%
	$25.04

	 EW-5
	# 706030X Ecologic W/B Gloss
	gal
	$41.90 
	40.00%
	$25.14

	8010
	(2) Exterior, Solvent Based, Type ES-6 thru ES-8
Mfg: Rodda Paint
Brand/Model: Rodda Paint

	 ES-6
	# 501801X Surfboard II WB
	gal
	$15.99 
	40.00%
	$9.60

	 ES-7
	# 121030X Exterior Flat Low Luster
	gal
	$29.53 
	40.00%
	$17.72

	 ES-8
	# 1118305 Alkyd S/G House Paint
	gal
	$31.82 
	40.00%
	$19.09

	8010
	(3) Interior, Water Based, Type IW-1 thru IW-10
Mfg: Rodda Paint
Brand/Model: Rodda Paint

	 IW-1
	# 513501X Horizon Flat
	gal
	$22.49 
	40.00%
	$13.49

	 IW-2
	 No Bid
	gal
	
	
	

	 IW-3
	# 543501X Horizon Semi-Gloss
	gal
	$25.99 
	40.00%
	$15.39

	 IW-4
	 No Bid
	
	   
	
	

	 IW-5
	# 706530X Ecologic W/B Low Lustre
	gal
	$39.35 
	40.00%
	$23.61

	 IW-6
	# 542001X Unique II Semi-Gloss Latex
	gal
	$22.49 
	40.00%
	$13.49

	 IW-7
	# 563101X Master Painter Pearl
	gal
	$16.99 
	40.00%
	$10.19

	 IW-8
	# 533364X Int Eggshell
	gal
	$19.84 
	40.00%
	$11.90

	 IW-9
	# 513101X Master Painter Flat
	gal
	$15.99 
	10.00%
	$9.59

	 IW-10
	# 543101X Master Painter Semi-Gloss
	gal
	$18.99 
	40.00%
	$11.39

	
	(4) Interior, Solvent Based, Type IS-7 thru Type IS-9
Mfg: Rodda Paint
Brand/Model: Rodda Paint

	 IS-7
	# 131630X Int Alkyd Flat
	gal
	$25.60 
	40.00%
	$15.36

	 IS-8
	#131330X Int Alkyd Eggshell
	gal
	$28.72 
	40.00%
	$17.23

	 IS-9
	# 131130X Int Alkyd Semi-Gloss
	gal
	$29.74 
	40.00%
	$17.84


(5) Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, Type MS-1 thru MS-10

Mfg: Various

	Brand/Model: Various
	

	MS-1
	 No Bid
	 
	   
	
	

	MS-2
	#89611 Watco Danish Oil Natural
	gal
	$29.95 
	25%
	$22.47

	MS-3
	#726400X Cat A Lac Satin Clear
	gal
	$20.20 
	40%
	$12.12

	MS-4
	#756400X Cat A Lac Gloss Clear
	gal
	$20.20 
	40%
	$12.12

	MS-5
	#756401X Cat A Lac Gloss White
	gal
	$29.76 
	40%
	$17.86

	MS-6
	#726401X Cat A Lac Satin White
	gal
	$29.76 
	40%
	$17.86

	MS-7
	#746401X Cat A Lac Semi-Gloss White
	gal
	$23.00 
	40%
	$13.80

	MS-8
	#868511 Heirloom Poly Satin
	gal
	$51.49 
	25%
	$38.62

	 MS-9
	#868531 Heirloom Polly Gloss
	gal
	$51.49 
	25%
	$38.62

	MS-10
	 No Bid
	 
	
	
	

	8010
	(6) Aerosol, Type AS-1 thru AS-3
Mfg: 
Brand/Model: 

	 AS-1
	 No Bid
	
	
	
	

	AS-2
	 No Bid
	
	
	
	

	AS-3
	 No Bid
	
	
	
	

	8010
	(7) Interior, Reprocessed Paint, Type RW-1 thru RW-2
Mfg: 
Brand/Model: 

	RW-1
	 No Bid
	
	
	
	

	RW-2
	 No bid
	
	
	
	

	8010
	(8) Miscellaneous Supplies, Type S-1
	
	
	Varied
	


	Alternate Contractor: Sherwin-Williams Paint Co.
Contact: Jason Lawrence

Phone: (425) 702-0260

Fax: (425) 702-5740

email: jason.lawrence@sherwin.com
Payment Address: 3949 Martin Way, Olympia, WA 98506

Order Address: 3949 Martin Way, Olympia, WA 98506

Freight Terms: Under $500- Freight Added.  $500 (or more) Prepaid and Included.

Shipping Terms: FOB Destination

Minimum Orders: NONE but see Excerpted Terms below.

Credit Care: Yes, Accepted.

Delivery: Three (3) calendar days after receipt of order (ARO)

Payment Terms: 0% 30 days

	Key: EW: Exterior, Water Based, ES: Exterior, Solvent Based, IW: Interior, Water Based, IS: Interior, Solvent Based, MS: Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, AS: Aerosol, RW: Reprocessed Paint, Water Based, S: Supplies

	Codes
	Description
	Unit
	 Unit Price 
	Discount %
	 Total Price 

	8010
	(1) Exterior, Water Based, Type EW-1 thru EW-5
Mfg: Sherwin-Williams
Brand/Model: Sherwin-Williams

	 EW-1
	# A-100 Latex Flat
	gal
	$19.86 
	34.00%
	$13.11 

	 EW-2
	# A-100 Latex Satin
	gal
	$22.19 
	34.00%
	$14.65 

	 EW-3
	# A-100 Latex Gloss
	gal
	$25.90 
	34.00%
	$17.09 

	 EW-4
	#Sher-Cryl Semi-Gloss-Light Industrial
	gal
	$39.08 
	34.00%
	$25.79 

	 EW-5
	No Bid
	
	   
	
	

	8010
	(2) Exterior, Solvent Based, Type ES-6 thru ES-8
Mfg: Sherwin-Williams
Brand/Model: Sherwin-Williams

	 ES-6
	Loxon Exterior Masonry Primer
	gal
	$22.25 
	25.00%
	$16.69 

	 ES-7
	#A14wf2011 Solid Alkyd Stain
	gal
	$21.15 
	34.00%
	$13.96 

	 ES-8
	Classic 99 Alkyd Semi-Gloss Enamel
	gal
	$28.40 
	34.00%
	$18.74 

	8010
	(3) Interior, Water Based, Type IW-1 thru IW-10
Mfg: Sherwin-Williams
Brand/Model: Sherwin-Williams

	 IW-1
	Harmony Low Ordor Int Flat
	gal
	$21.17 
	34.00%
	$13.97 

	 IW-2
	Harmony Low Ordor Int Eggshell
	gal
	$22.97 
	34.00%
	$15.16 

	 IW-3
	Harmony Low Ordor Semi-Gloss
	gal
	$23.90 
	34.00%
	$15.77 

	 IW-4
	No Bid
	
	   
	
	

	 IW-5
	Super Paint Int Satin-High Performance
	gal
	$25.08 
	34.00%
	$16.55 

	 IW-6
	Ser-Cryl Semi-Gloss-High Performance
	gal
	$39.08 
	34.00%
	$25.79 

	 IW-7
	ProMar 400 Eggshell
	gal
	$14.50 
	34.00%
	$9.57 

	 IW-8
	Quali-Kote Eggshell
	gal
	$17.26 
	34.00%
	$11.39 

	 IW-9
	Quali-Kote Flat
	gal
	$14.83 
	34.00%
	$9.79 

	 IW-10
	ProMar 400 Gloss
	gal
	$17.50 
	34.00%
	$11.55 

	
	(4) Interior, Solvent Based, Type IS-7 thru Type IS-9
Mfg: Kelly-Moore
Brand/Model: Kelly-Moore

	 IS-7
	ProMar 200 Alkyd Flat
	gal
	$23.32 
	34.00%
	$15.39 

	 IS-8
	ProMar 200 Alkyd Flat Eggshell
	gal
	$25.50 
	34.00%
	$16.83 

	 IS-9
	ProMar 200 Alkyd Semi-Gloss
	gal
	$27.20 
	34.00%
	$17.95 


(5) Interior/Exterior, Solvent Based, Type MS-1 thru MS-10

Mfg: Various

	Brand/Model: Various
	

	MS-1
	Zinsar Bullseye Shellac
	gal
	$25.25 
	34.00%
	$16.67 

	MS-2
	Danish Oil
	gal
	$24.60 
	34.00%
	$16.24 

	MS-3
	Sherwood Moisture Resist Lacquer Satin
	gal
	$26.04 
	34.00%
	$17.19 

	MS-4
	Sherwood Moisture Lacquer Gloss
	gal
	$26.46 
	34.00%
	$17.46 

	MS-5
	Opex Production Lacquer Pigmented Flat
	gal
	$28.89 
	34.00%
	$19.07 

	MS-6
	Opex Production Lacquer Pigmented Satin
	gal
	$28.99 
	34.00%
	$19.13 

	MS-7
	Opex Production Lacquer Pigmented Semi-Gloss
	gal
	$28.99 
	34.00%
	$19.13 

	MS-8
	Opex Production Lacquer Pigmented
	gal
	$29.14 
	34.00%
	$19.23 

	 MS-9
	Sherwin-Williams Wood Classics Fast Dry Gloss
	gal
	$18.92 
	34.00%
	$12.49 

	MS-10
	Sherwin-Williams Wood Classics Fast Dry Satin
	gal
	$19.00 
	34.00%
	$12.54 

	8010
	(6) Aerosol, Type AS-1 thru AS-3
Mfg: Sherwin-Williams
Brand/Model: Sherwin-Williams

	 AS-1
	Shermark Marking Paint
	17 oz
	$4.57 
	34.00%
	$3.02 

	AS-2
	Sherliner Striping Paint
	17 oz
	$4.57 
	34.00%
	$3.02 

	AS-3
	Fiels Marking Paint
	17 oz
	$4.57 
	34.00%
	$3.02 

	8010
	(7) Interior, Reprocessed Paint, Type RW-1 thru RW-2
Mfg: Visions Recycle
Brand/Model: Visions Recycle

	RW-1
	Interior Latex Semi Gloss
	gal
	$15.00 
	0%
	$15.00 

	RW-2
	Interior Latex Flat
	gal
	$15.00 
	0%
	$15.00 

	8010
	(8) Miscellaneous Supplies, Type S-1
	Varied
	Key
Account
	32%
	Net


	
	
	
	


TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS: Paints and Paint Related Products 
	Class
	Code
	Type
	Description
	Gloss 
	MPI Ref#
	Std Ref#

	Exterior
	Water Based
	EW-1
	Latex , Conventional Latex 
	1-Flat
	10
	TT-P-19

	
	
	EW-2
	Latex , Conventional Latex 
	5-Semi-gloss
	11
	TT-P-19

	
	
	EW-3
	Latex , Conventional Latex 
	6-Gloss
	119
	TT-P-19

	
	
	EW-4
	Waterborne Light Industrial 
	5-Semi-gloss
	163
	TT-P-29

	
	
	EW-5
	Waterborne Light Industrial 
	6-Gloss
	164
	TT-P-29

	Exterior
	Solvent Based
	ES-6
	Alkali Resistant Primer
	 
	3
	TT-E-489

	
	
	ES-7
	Alkyd
	1-Flat
	8
	TT-E-489

	
	
	ES-8
	Alkyd
	Semi-gloss
	94
	TT-E-489

	Interior
	Water Based
	IW-1
	Institutional Low Odor/VOC Latex
	1-Flat
	143
	A-A-2246

	
	
	IW-2
	Institutional Low Odor/VOC Latex
	3-Eggshell
	145
	A-A-2246

	
	
	IW-3
	Institutional Low Odor/VOC Latex
	5-Semi-gloss
	147
	A-A-2246

	
	
	IW-4
	Institutional Low Odor/VOC Latex
	6-Gloss
	148
	A-A-2246

	
	
	IW-5
	Architectural Latex
	3-Eggshell
	139
	A-A-2246

	
	
	IW-6
	Architectural Latex
	5-Semi-gloss
	141
	A-A-2246

	
	
	IW-7
	Interior Latex
	2-Velvet-like
	44
	TT-P-29

	
	
	IW-8
	Interior Latex
	3-Eggshell
	52
	TT-P-29

	
	
	IW-9
	Interior Latex
	1-Flat
	53
	TT-P-29

	
	
	IW-10
	Interior Latex
	5-Semi-gloss
	54
	TT-P-29

	Interior
	Solvent Based
	IS-7
	Alkyd
	1-Flat
	49
	A-A-2962

	
	
	IS-8
	Alkyd
	3-Eggshell
	51
	TT-E-2784

	
	
	IS-9
	Alkyd
	5-Semi-gloss
	47
	A-A-2962

	Interior/Exterior
	Solvent Based
	MS-1
	Shellac
	 
	88
	 

	
	
	MS-2
	Danish Oil
	 
	92
	 

	
	
	MS-3
	Lacquer, Clear
	Flat
	87
	 

	
	
	MS-4
	Lacquer, Clear
	Gloss
	86
	 

	
	
	MS-5
	Lacquer, Pigmented
	Gloss
	124
	 

	
	
	MS-6
	Lacquer, Pigmented
	Satin
	122
	 

	
	
	MS-7
	Lacquer, Pigmented
	Semi-gloss
	123
	 

	
	
	MS-8
	Varnish
	Flat
	73
	TT-V-85

	
	
	MS-9
	Varnish
	Gloss
	75
	TT-V-85

	
	
	MS-10
	Varnish
	Semi-gloss
	74
	TT-V-85

	Aerosol
	Aerosol
	AS-1
	Layout, Marking, Survey Paint
	 
	 
	 

	
	
	AS-2
	Striping Paint
	 
	 
	 

	
	
	AS-3
	Field Marking Paint
	 
	 
	 

	Interior
	Water Based
	RW-1
	Reprocessed Paint, Latex
	Semi-gloss
	 
	TT-P-2846

	
	
	RW-2
	Reprocessed Paint, Latex
	Flat
	 
	TT-P-2846

	 
	Supplies
	S-1
	Miscellaneous Supplies
	 
	 
	 


Allowable VOC levels (grams/liter)(grams/gallons): (Apply to Paints and Paint Related Products – IW-1 thru IW-4) ONLY

Type of Paint


VOCs (g/l)

VOCs (g/g)





Interior Architectural

Flat



50


0.42

Non-flat


150


1.25

Exterior Architectural

Flat



100


0.83

Non-flat


200


1.66

Anti-Corrosive

Flat



250


2.1

Semi-gloss


250


2.1

Gloss



250


2.1

Reprocessed Paint

Recycled paint is made from paint collected through public and private collection programs.  Reprocessed paint is mixed with virgin materials such as resins and colorants, and then extensively tested before packaging for resale.  Reprocessed paint is made with a minimum of 20% post consumer recycled material.  Reprocessed latex paint shall meet or exceed standards required for virgin latex paint products.

Paint Supplies to include but not limited to: brushes, rags, paint scrapers, roller attachments, brushes, etc.

THE FOLLOWING SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS ARE PARAGRAPH SECTIONS EXCERPTED/ABRIDGED FROM STATE MASTER CONTRACT 15504 GLASS BEADS FOR TRAFFIC MARKING PAINT.  PARAGRAPH SECTIONS MAY BE LISTED OUT-OF-ORDER FOR EASE OF OPERATION.
ORDER FULFILLMENT REQUIREMENTS 

1. There will be no minimum order amount. Contract purchasers may place orders against this contract either in person, electronically, fax or by phone. Once an order is issued, the following shall apply: 

1. All orders purchased against this contract shall be FOB destination freight prepaid and charged.  No COD deliveries will be accepted.

2. Orders designated as Will Call, by the customer are to be FOB origin, regardless of the dollar amount of the order.

3. The contractor will make every effort to ensure the expeditious delivery of all contract orders.  Failure to fulfill quoted delivery schedules may subject the contractor to liquidated damages. Furthermore, a pattern of prolonged delivery delays may be cause for contract termination.

4. The contractor shall provide a “Customer Service” representative who will be responsible for resolving contract performance issues (examples might include but are not limited to order fulfillment delays, receipt of damaged goods, product returns, etc.) 

5. Unless special delivery requirements have been pre-arranged and communicated, deliveries are to be off-loaded at purchasers receiving dock or designated job site during the normal work hours (Monday through Friday from 8 AM to 5 PM). The contractor is responsible for coordinating with customers and carrier(s) the delivery schedule, shipping instructions and location delivery details. If it is determined that order fulfillment could potentially exceed the typical order fulfillment lead time, the contractor shall advise the purchaser within 24 hours following receipt of the order. In such cases, the state reserves the right to purchase elsewhere (without being liable for cancellation/restocking fees) should the anticipated delivery lead-time adversely affect project scheduling. 

6. Product damaged as a result of contractor negligence will either be replaced (and expedited at contractor’s expense) or if the customer prefers, be noted on the receiving report and deducted from final payment. Additionally, the contractor will be responsible for shipping costs and arranging for pick-up of any defective returns, and arranging for a Call Tag to insure freight is charged to Contractor for defective returns, within ten (10) business days.

7. Should an order include a specialty item(s), the contractor’s or manufacturer’s restocking fees concerning the specialty item(s) shall be communicated and approved by customer upon receipt of the purchase order. 

8. All costs for packaging/containers shall be borne by the contractor.  All products shall conform to the provisions set forth in the federal, county, state and city laws for their product, handling, processing and labeling.  Packages shall be so constructed to ensure safe transportation to point of delivery.
THE FOLLOWING ARE ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS BY OPERATION OF LAW:
I.  Best Buy: In purchasing situations where the Office of State Procurement has not granted to State Agencies the authority to purchase “off-contract”, the following provision applies: Contract is subject to RCW 43.19.190(2) & RCW 43.19.1905(7): which authorizes state agencies to purchase materials, supplies, services, and equipment of equal quantity and quality to those on state contract from non-contract suppliers.  Provided that an agency subsequently notifies the Office of State Procurement (OSP) Procurement Coordinator that the pricing is less costly for such goods or services than the price from the state contractor.
If the non-contract supplier's pricing is less, the state contractor shall be given the opportunity by the state agency to at least meet the non-contractor's price.  If the state contractor cannot meet the price, then the state agency may purchase the item(s) from the non-contract supplier, document the transactions on the appropriate form developed by OSP and forwarded to the Procurement Coordinator on the state contract.
If a lower price can be identified on a repeated basis, the state reserves the right to renegotiate the pricing structure of this agreement.  In the event such negotiations fail, the state reserves the right to delete such item(s) from the contract.
II.  Only authorized purchasers included in the State of Washington Purchasing Cooperative (WSPC) and State of Oregon Cooperative Purchasing Program (DASCPP/ORCPP) listings published and updated periodically by OSP and DAS may purchase from this contract.  It is the contractor’s responsibility to verify membership of these organizations prior to processing orders received under this contract.  A list of Washington members is available on the Internet http://www.ga.wa.gov/pca/cooplist.htm, and a list of the Oregon members is available at http://tpps.das.state.or.us/purchasing/orcpp_mem.html contractors shall not process state contract orders from unauthorized users.
III.  Contract Terms: This Document includes by reference all terms and conditions published in the original IFB, including Standard Terms and Conditions, and Definitions, included in the Competitive Procurement Standards published by OSP.

	

	CCI HISTORY:

	Revision

Date:
	Effective

Date:
	CCI # & DESCRIPTION

	03/23/07
	04/01/07
	CCI 04: Contract Extension:  Contract is extended through 3/31/09 with Alpine Products, Kelly-Moore Paint, Parker Paint, Rodda Paint and Sherwin-Williams Paint.  Update variable data.

	4/24/06
	4/24/06
	CCI 03:

· Environmentally Friendly: Highlight Available Recycled Paint Products.
· Admin Change: Update OSP Alternate Contact.

	8/23/05
	8/23/05
	CCI 02: Admin Change: Update OSP Primary Contact.

	4/4/05
	4/1/05
	CCI 01: Contract Award: Contract awarded, the effective date is 4/1/04.

	


Embedded Reference Files: N/A
IFB: N/A    Bid Amendment: N/A    CPS: N/A
OFFICE OF STATE PROCUREMENT

PERFORMANCE REPORT

To OSP Customers:

Please take a moment to let us know how our services have measured up to your expectations on this contract.  Please copy this form locally as needed and forward to the Office of State Procurement Purchasing Manager.  For any comments marked unacceptable, please explain in remarks block.

	Procurement services provided:
	Excellent
	Good
	Acceptable
	Unacceptable

	· Timeliness of contract actions
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 


	· Professionalism and courtesy of staff
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 


	· Services provided met customer needs
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 


	· Knowledge of procurement rules and regulations
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 


	· Responsiveness/problem resolution
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 


	· Timely and effective communications
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	 FORMCHECKBOX 



Comments: 













Agency: 





Prepared by: 












Title: 






Contract No.: 
15504




Date: 




Contract Title: Paint and Paint Related Items
Phone: 



Send to:

Purchasing Manager

Office of State Procurement

PO Box 41017

Olympia, Washington 98504-1017

PRODUCT/SERVICE PERFORMANCE REPORT

Complete this form to report problems with suppliers or to report unsatisfactory product or services.  You are also encouraged to report superior performance.  Agency personnel should contact suppliers in an effort to resolve problems themselves prior to completion and submission of this report.

Contract number and title: 
15504 Paint and Paint Related Items




Supplier’s name: 



 Supplier’s representative: 




	PRODUCT/SERVICE:



	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Contract item quality higher than required
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Damaged goods delivered

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Contract item quality lower than required.
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Item delivered does not meet P.O./contract specifications

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Other:
	
	

	SUPPLIER/CONTRACTOR PERFORMANCE:



	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Late delivery
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Slow response to problems and problem resolution

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Incorrect invoice pricing.
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Superior performance

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Other:
	
	

	CONTRACT PROVISIONS:



	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Terms and conditions inadequate
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Additional items or services are required.

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Specifications need to be revised
	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Minimum order too high.

	 FORMCHECKBOX 

	Other:
	
	


Briefly describe situation: 























	Agency Name:
	Delivery Location:

	Prepared By:
	Phone Number:
	Date:
	Supervisor:

	
	
	
	


Send To:

MICHAEL MAVERICK

CONTRACTS SPECIALIST

OFFICE OF STATE PROCUREMENT

PO BOX 41017

OLYMPIA WA  98504-1017
2

