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The City of Seattle
PURCHASING SERVICES
700 — 3™ AVE #910

Seattle, WA 98104-1808

Vendor #0000003557
WILBUR-ELLIS COMPANY
1519 14™ ST NW
AUBURN WA 98001

Contact: MICHAEL ERB
Phone #: 800-275-6920
Fax#  253-351-6876

VENDOR CONTRACT
Vendor Contract # Date Change Order #
0000001138 7/21/2011 2
Payment Terms Freight Terms
Net 30 Prepaid & Allowed FOB: DESTINATION
Buyer: FAX: Phone:
Sara Schutt 206-386-0068 206-684-0456

Ship To:
SEE BELOW

Bill To:

SEE BELOW

Wilbur-Ellis Company was awarded a contract for providing Horticultural & Related Products for the City of
Seattle as a result of RFP LTC - 003. The contract term will be for five years, from 10/29/03 through
9/30/08, with the option to extend for three additional one-year extensions. Specification per Attachment
#1 and Attachment, #2 Terms and Conditions.

Original Contract Term: 10/29/03 — 9/30/08
Change Order #1: 10/1/08 — 9/30/11 Contract extension for (3) three years and price increase.

Change Order #2: 7/21/2011 - 9/30/12, issued to extend contract to allow time to rebid.

Orders shall be placed by City Departments. Invoices shall be mailed in duplicate to the City Department

Accounts Payable, per attached list. Each invoice shall indicate Contract #0000001138.

The City does not guarantee utilization of this contract. This contract is subject to cancellation by either
party upon thirty (30) days advanced written notice. The City may award contracts to other vendors for
similar products or services. Actual utilization will be based on availability, proximity of vendor facilities,
frequency of deliveries, or any other factor deemed important to the City.

Pricing increases or decreases may be requested by either party by written notice to Purchasing within
forty-five (45) days of the contract anniversary date and can be implemented only by contract change

order.

Vendor is required to maintain insurance coverage’s as specified in the RFQ's Terms and Conditions.

This contract replaces B99928 with same vendor.

Authorized Signature/Date
i : L-s_///
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Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Wilbur-Ellis Company
1519 14™ ST NW
Auburn, WA 98001
TEL: 800-275-6920
FAX: 253-351-6876

HORTICULTURAL & RELATED PRODUCTS

* denotes price updates

Mfr’s List
Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
INSECTICIDES
1 ARI Wasp & Hornet Killer — Wasp Freeze PT 515 170z $ 8.9002*
2 Conserve SC Quart $89.90
3 Dipel 2X or 4L DF 11b $12.04/1b
4 Dursban Pro 2 gal $50.64/gal
5 Enstar 2E 50z $14.00 oz
6 Gnatrol (Vectobac) 1 gal $31.51 gal
2.5 gal $28.72 gal
7 M-PEDE 2.5 gal $24.66 gal*
8 Orthene 768, Orthene T8O $7.73/1b $12.79/can
9 Orthene PT 1300 12 oz. $12.47/o0z
10 Preclude 6 oz 26.41/can
11 Pyreth-It PT 1100 1 gal $261.00/gal
12 Talstar GC Flowable Quart $60.28/qt
Gal $236/gal




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Mfr’s List

Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
13 Tame 2.4 EC Quart $199.93/qt




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
HERBICIDES
14 Banvel 2.5 gal $100/gal
15 Casaron 4G 50 Ib $1.89/1b
16 Confront 1 gal No bid*
17 Corn Gluten Meal — Nutra Maze 50 Ib bag No bid*
18 Crossbow 1 gal $52.00*gl
2.5 gal $51.00*gl
19 Devrinol SOWP 4 b $10.66/1b
20 Drive 75 DF 11b $82.19/1b
21 Gallery 75 DF 11b $243.00
22 Garlon 4 2.5 gal $93.00
' $71.00gal*
23 Krenite 2.5 gal
24 Oust XP 48 oz. $12.87/0z
25 Pathfinder 11 2.5 gal $40.43 gal
26 Rodeo 2.5 gal $58.98*
27 Roundup (18% Conc) \1 gal $81.45
2.5 gal $44 .83*
15 gal $42.42*
30 gal $40.32
28 Super Trimec 1 gal $71.92
2.5 gal $70.89




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Mifr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
29 Surflan AS 2.5 gal $108.92
30 Trimec Bentgrass Formula 1 gal $29.32
2.5 gal $28.29
FUNGICIDES
31 Aliette 551b $24.25/1b
32 Banner Maxx 1 gal $270.00 gal
33 Bayleton 1% - Bayleton 50180 22 oz 5.95/0z
34 Blocker 10g 50 1b $1.051b
35 Chipco 26 gt 2.5 gal $131.21/gal
36 Consyst 21b $£13.89/1b
37 Daconcil 5% 251b No bid
38 Dithane T80 — Rainshield/ Pprotect 12 1b 4.44 Ib*
3 FFII 14-3-3 3551b $106.00bag*
40 Fluid Fungicide 5 gal $121.25/gal
41 Fungicide IX 42.21b $103.05/1b*
42 Fungicide VIII 22-3-5 $33.61b $94.53.87/Ib*
43 Fungicide X $52.8 $87.331b*
44 Fungo Flo 2.5 gal $168.00/gal
45 Junction 6 Ibs $10.80Ib*




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Mifr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
46 Medallion 8oz ‘| $121.84/container
47 Penstar Flo 4 gal $41.79 gal
48 Prostar 70 WP 11b $51.99/1b
49 Rubigan AS 1 gal $342.44/gal




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Item #

Description

Container Size

Mifr’s List
Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal

50

Blazon (Spray pattern indicator)

9.59

$42.48/bag

MISCELLANEOUS

51

Ammonium Phosphate 16-21-0

50 1b bag

No bid

52

List your firm’s Fertilizer Products below and in

differing container (bag) Sizes:
Pro Spring Plus
All American Pro
Workhouse Gold
Kwik Kick
Protau

Gold Medal

Five Iron

Long Drive

Pro Summer

Six Iron

Pro Fall

Pro Fall Plus
Costomb

One to One
Wilgro Weed & Feed
No Phos

Mini SK

Mini N2K

Mini Eagle

Super Starter
Turf Marks

Pro Start

Pro Balance

Pro

Wi

Mini Par

Mini K

Mini Drive

50 1b
501b
501b
501b
501b
501b
501b
50 1b

No bid the
All Wilbur Ellis
branded
fertilizers




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138

7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Item #

Description

Container Size

Mifr’s List
Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal

Mini M Durance
Mini Plus




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Mifr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Per Unit
Size oz/Ib/qt/gal
53 Gypsum 50 1b $11.50bg*
54 Calprill 50 1b $7.71bg*
55 Doloprill 50 Ib $7.79bg*
56 Miloganite 50 Ib $13.19bg*
57 Turface MVP — Play Ball 501b $8.38*
Regular 50 1b $8.38*
Fine 501b $8.38*
WETTING AGENTS
58 Cascade Plus
Primer Select 5¢l $62.95
$53.62
34 Cascade Granular — Tricure 5 $59.18
30 $47.53
35 $41.62
60 Yucca — Aquaduct 2.3 $45.22
5 $42.65
34 $39.66
61 Terra-Sorb Potassium Hydrogen
OTHER INSECTICIDES
62 Zep Tox Wasp & Hornet — Wasp Freeze 12 0z $54.00
OTHER HERBICIDES
63 Turflon Ester 19 Ib $134.56




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Per Unit
Size oz/lb/qt/gal
64 XL-2G 5 $1.251b
Weed & Grass Perverter 41b $1.06 1b
65 Certified 100% 3-Way Perennial Rye Grass 50 Ibs $.1.20Ib*
Fairway Supreme
WILBUR-ELLIS ORGANIC PRODUCTS
66 Bone Meal — Ground Raw Chips — 50# Bag 3-15-0 50 1b No bid on all
_ organic fertilize
and Dr earth
products
67 | Steamed Bone Meal 2-20-0
68 | Feather Meal 11-0-0
69 Fish Meal 11-0-0
70 Cotton Seed Meal 5-2-1
71 Blood Meal 13-0-0
72 Kelp Meal
73 Alfalfa Meal
74 Ground Fish Bone Meal 4-20-0
75 Rock Phosphate
76 A-Maize-N (Crumble form) 9-0-0
77 Meat and Bone Meal 7-5-0 NPK
78 Dr. Earth Rhody, Azalea & Camillia 4-5-4




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
7/21/2011 through 9/30/2012

Mfr’s List Price

Item # Description Container Per Unit
Size oz/lb/qt/gal
No bid Dr earth
79 Dr. Earth Tomato, Vegetable & Herb 5-7-3 products

80 Dr. Earth Rose & Flower 5-7-2

81 Dr. Earth Starter 2-4-2

82 Dr. All Purpose 4-4-4

83 Dr. Earth Fruit 7-4-2

84 Dr. Earth Bud & Bloom 4-10-7

NOTE: You may offer any related products, include a MSDS sheet or brochure or description for
any related product you offer.

Minimum Order Amount Delivered $1000.00* & $50.00 picked up by the City of Seattle

Payment Terms: Pricing firm for first year of contract
Second year 3%
Third year 3%
Fourth year 3%
Fifth year 3%

Escalation percentage for option year six through eight will be established in an agreement between

the parties not later than 30 days prior to the end of year five contract year. Failure to reach an
agreement will cause the contract to be canceled at the end of contract year five.

-10-




‘@) VENDOR CONTRACT ™\

The City of Seattle Vendor Contract # Date Change Order #
PURCHASING SERVICES 0000001138 9/29/08 1
i i Payment Terms Freight Terms
Seattle, WA 98104-1808
Net 30 Prepaid & Allowed FOB: DESTINATION
Buyer: FAX: Phone:
Sharon Rothwell 206-386-0068 206-684-8310
Vendor #0000003557 Ship To:
WILBUR-ELLIS COMPANY
1519 14™ ST NW SEE BELOW
AUBURN WA 98001
Contact: MICHAEL ERB Bill To:
Phone #: 800-275-6920
Fax#  253-351-6876 SEE BELOW

Wilbur-Ellis Company was awarded a contract for providing Horticultural & Related Products for the City of
Seattle as a result of RFP LTC - 003. The contract term will be for five years, from 10/29/03 through
9/30/08, with the option to extend for three additional one-year extensions. Specification per Attachment
#1 and Attachment, #2 Terms and Conditions.

Original Contract Term: 10/29/03 — 9/30/08
Change Order #1: 10/1/08 — 9/30/11 Contract extension for (3) three years and price increase.

Orders shall be placed by City Departments. Invoices shall be mailed in duplicate to the City Department
Accounts Payable, per attached list. Each invoice shall indicate Contract #0000001138.

The City does not guarantee utilization of this contract. This contract is subject to cancellation by either
party upon thirty (30) days advanced written notice. The City may award contracts to other vendors for
similar products or services. Actual utilization will be based on availability, proximity of vendor facilities,
frequency of deliveries, or any other factor deemed important to the City.

Pricing increases or decreases may be requested by either party by written notice to Purchasing within
forty-five (45) days of the contract anniversary date and can be implemented only by contract change
order. '

Vendor is required to maintain insurance coverage's as specified in the RFQ’s Terms and Conditions.

This contract replaces B99928 with same vendor.

Authorized Signature/Date
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Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2009

Wilbur-Ellis Company
1519 14™ STNW
Auburn, WA 98001
TEL: 800-275-6920
FAX: 253-351-6876

HORTICULTURAL & RELATED PRODUCTS

* denotes price updates

Mifr’s List
Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
INSECTICIDES
1 ARI Wasp & H&met Killer — Wasp Freeze PT 515 170z $ 8.900z*
2 Conserve SC Quart $89.90
3 Dipel 2X or 4L DF 11b $12.04/1b
4 Dursban Pro 2 gal $50.64/gal
5 Enstar 2E 50z $14.00 oz
6 Gnatrol (Vectobac) 1 gal $31.51 gal
2.5 gal $28.72 gal
7 M-PEDE 2.5 gal $24.66 gal*
8 Orthene 76S, Orthene T8O $7.73/1b $12.79/can
9 Orthene PT 1300 12 oz. $12.47/0z
10 Preclude 6 oz 26.41/can
11 Pyreth-It PT 1100 1 gal $261.00/gal
12 Talstar GC Flowable Quart $60.28/qt
Gal $236/gal




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138

10/29/03 through 9/30/2009

Mifr’s List

Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
13 Tame 2.4 EC Quart $199.93/qt




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138

10/29/03 through 9/30/2009
Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
HERBICIDES
14 Banvel 2.5 gal $100/gal
15 Casaron 4G 501b $1.89/1b
16 Confront 1 gal No bid*
17 Corn Gluten Meal — Nutra Maze 50 Ib bag No bid*
18 Crossbow 1 gal $52.00%gl
2.5 gal $51.00*gl
19 Devrinol SOWP 41b $10.66/1b
20 Drive 75 DF 11b $82.19/1b
21 Gallery 75 DF 11b $243.00
22 Garlon 4 2.5 gal $93.00
$71.00gal*
23 Krenite 2.5 gal
24 Oust XP 48 oz. $12.87/oz
25 Pathfinder II 2.5 gal $40.43 gal
26 Rodeo 2.5 gal $58.98*
27 Roundup (18% Conc) \1 gal $81.45
2.5 gal $44.83*
15 gal $42.42%
30 gal $40.32
28 Super Trimec 1 gal $71.92
2.5 gal $70.89




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138

10/29/03 through 9/30/2009
Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
29 Surflan AS 2.5 gal $108.92
30 Trimec Bentgrass Formula 1 gal $29.32
2.5 gal $28.29
FUNGICIDES |

31 Aliette 5.51b $24.25/1b
32 Banner Maxx 1 gal $270.00 gal
33 Bayleton 1% - Bayleton 50180 22 oz 5.95/0z
34 Blocker 10g 50 Ib $1.051b
35 Chipco 26 gt 2.5 gal $131.21/gal
36 Consyst 21b $13.89/1b
37 Daconcil 5% 251b No bid
38 Dithane T80 — Rainshield/ Pprotect 121b 4;44 1b*
39 FFII 14-3-3 35.51b $106.00bag*
40 Fluid Fungicide 5 gal $121.25/gal
41 Fungicide IX 42.21b $103.05/1b*
42 Fungicide VIII 22-3-5 $33.61b $94.53.87/1b*
43 Fungicide X $52.8 $87.331b*
44 Fungo Flo 2.5 gal $168.00/gal
45 Junction 6 Ibs $10.801b*




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138

10/29/03 through 9/30/2009
Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
_ oz/lb/qt/gal
46 Medallion 8 0z $121.84/container
47 Penstar Flo 4 gal $41.79 gal
48 Prostar 70 WP 11b $51.99/1b
49 Rubigan AS 1 gal $342.44/gal




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2009

Ttem #

Description

Container Size

Mifr’s List
Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal

50

Blazon (Spray pattemn indicator)

9.59

$42.48/bag

MISCELLANEOUS

51

Ammonium Phosphate 16-21-0

50 1b bag

No bid

52

List your firm’s Fertilizer Products below and in

differing container (bag) Sizes:
Pro Spring Plus

All American Pro
Workhouse Gold
Kwik Kick

Protau

Gold Medal

Five Iron

Long Drive

Pro Summer

Six Iron

Pro Fall

Pro Fall Plus
Costomb

One to One ‘
Wilgro Weed & Feed
No Phos

Mini SK

Mini N2K

Mini Eagle

Super Starter

Turf Marks

Pro Start

Pro Balance

Pro

Wi

Mini Par

- Mini K

Mini Drive

501b
501b
501b
50 1b
501b
501b
501b
50 1b

No bid the
All Wilbur Ellis
branded
fertilizers




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2009

Mifr’s List
Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
Mini M Durance
Mini Plus




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2009

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Per Unit
Size oz/lb/qt/gal
53 Gypsum 501b $11.50bg*
54 Calprill 501b $7.71bg*
55 Doloprill 50 1b $7.79bg*
56 Miloganite 501b $13.19bg*
57 Turface MVP — Play Ball 50 1b $8.38%*
Regular 501b $8.38%
Fine 50 1b $8.38*
WETTING AGENTS
58 Cascade Plus
Primer Select 5gl $62.95
$53.62
59 Cascade Granular — Tricure 5 $59.18
30 $47.53
35 $41.62
60 Yucca — Aquaduct 2.5 $45.22
5 $42.65
34 $39.66
61 Terra-Sorb Potassium Hydrogen
OTHER INSECTICIDES
62 Zep Tox Wasp & Homet — Wasp Freeze 12 oz $54.00
OTHER HERBICIDES
63 Turflon Ester . $134.56

19 1b




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2009

Mifr’s List Price

Item # Description Container Per Unit
: Size oz/lb/qt/gal
64 XL-2G 5 $1.251b
Weed & Grass Perverter 41b $1.06 1b
65 Certified 100% 3-Way Perennial Rye Grass 50 Ibs $.1.201b*
Fairway Supreme
WILBUR-ELLIS ORGANIC PRODUCTS
66 Bone Meal — Ground Raw Chips — 50# Bag 3-15-0 501b No bid on all
organic fertilize
and Dr earth
products
67 Steamed Bone Meal 2-20-0
68 Feather Meal 11-0-0
69 Fish Meal 11-0-0
- 70 Cotton Seed Meal 5-2-1
71 Blood Meal 13-0-0
72 Kelp Meal
73 Alfalfa Meal
74 | Ground Fish Bone Meal 4-20-0 .
25 Rock Phosphate
76 A-Maize-N (Crumble form) 9-0-0
11 Meat and Bone Meal 7-5-0 NPK
78 Dr. Earth Rhody, Azalea & Camillia 4-5-4




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2009

: Mifr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Per Unit
Size oz/lb/qt/gal
No bid Dr earth
79 Dr. Earth Tomato, Vegetable & Herb 5-7-3 products
80 Dr. Earth Rose & Flower 5-7-2
81 Dr. Earth Starter 2-4-2
82 Dr. All Purpose 4-4-4
83 Dr. Earth Fruit 7-4-2
84 Dr. Earth Bud & Bloom 4-10-7

NOTE: You may offer any related products, include a MSDS sheet or brochure or description for
any related product you offer.

Minimum Order Amount Delivered $1000.00* & $50.00 picked up by the City of Seattle

Payment Terms: Pricing firm for first year of contract

Second year 3%
Third year 3%
Fourth year 3%
Fifth year 3%

Escalation percentage for option year six through eight will be established in an agreement between
the parties not later than 30 days prior to the end of year five contract year. Failure to reach an

agreement will cause the contract to be canceled at the end of contract year five.

-10 -




&

The City of Seattle
PURCHASING SERVICES
700 — 3 AVE #910

Seattle, WA 98104-1808

Vendor #0000003557
WILBUR-ELLIS COMPANY
1519 14™ ST NW
AUBURN WA 98001

Contact: MICHAEL ERB
Phone #: 800-275-6920
Fax#:  253-351-6876

VENDOR CONTRACT
Vendor Contract # Date Change Order #
0000001138 10/29/03
Payment Terms Freight Terms
Net 30 Prepaid & Allowed FOB: DESTINATION

Buyer: FAX:

Sara Schutt

206-386-0068

Phone:
206-684-0456

Ship To:

SEE BELOW

Bill To:

SEE BELOW

WILBUR-ELLIS COMPANY is awarded a contract for providing the City of Seattle with HORTICULTURAL
& RELATED PRODUCTS. The contract term will be for five years, from 10/29/03 through 9/30/08, with
the option to extend for three additional one-year extensions. Specification per Attachment #1 and

Attachment #2 Terms and Conditons.

Orders shall be placed by City Departments. Invoices shall be mailed in duplicate to the City Department

Accounts Payable, per attached list. Each invoice shall indicate Contract #0000001138.

The City does not guarantee utilization of this contract. This contract is subject to cancellation by either
party upon thirty (30) days advanced written notice. The City may award contracts to other vendors for
similar products or services. Actual utilization will be based on availability, proximity of vendor facilities,
frequency of deliveries, or any other factor deemed important to the City.

Pricing increases or decreases may be requested by either party by written notice to Purchasing within
forty-five (45) days of the contract anniversary date and can be implemented only by contract change

order.

Vendor is required to maintain insurance coverage's as specified in the RFQ's Terms and Conditions.

This contract is subject to your proposal dated 6/25/03

This contract replaces B99928 with same vendor.

If prompt delivery/service or pick-up of contract materials cannot be effected, please notify Sara Schutt,
Finance/Purchasing Services, at 206-684-0456.







Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001140
11/3/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
Safer Moss/Algae 320z $5.05
37
1 Gallon $66.00
38 Super Trimec
Surflan AS/Generic 1 Gallon/ $97.00 1 Gallon $121.00
38
FUNGICIDES
Aliette 1# $10.15
39
Bayleton 1% 50DI 1# $80.00
40
Blocker 10g 1# $6.50
41
Camelot 1 Gallon $87.00
42
Chipco 26 gt 1 Gallon $155.00
43
1 Gallon $98.00
44 Cinnamite
1# $16.00
45 Consyst
Daconil 5% 1 Gallon $23.00
46
Dithane — 45 1 Gallon $18.00
47
Fluid Fungicide s $138.00
48
Fore Flowable 1# $6.50
49
Fungicide IX 50# $120.00
50
4l Fungicide VIII 25# $85.00
Fungicide X 32.7 # $130.00
52




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001140
11/3/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/1b/qt/gal
HERBICIDES
Banvel 1 Gallon $100.00
20
1# $2.15
21 Casaron
Casaron 4 G 504 $97.00
22
Confront 1 Gallon $121.00
23
Corn Gluten Meal 50# $12.00
24
Crossbow 1 Gallon $51.00
25
Devrional S0WP 1# $10.50
26
AG Type 1# $9.50
27
Drive 75 DF 1# $86.00
28
Gallery 75 DF 1# $150.00
29
Garlon 4 1 Gallon $109.00
30
Lontrel 1 Quart $160.00
31
Moss-Out Granules S# $7.95
32
33 Oust 1# $225.00
Pathfinder II 1 Gallon $39.75
34
Poast 1 Gallon $82.60
35
Rodeo 1 Gallon $82.60
36




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Wilbur-Ellis Company
1519 14™ STNW
Auburn, WA 98001
TEL: 800-275-6920
FAX: 253-351-6876

HORTICULTURAL & RELATED PRODUCTS

Mfr’s List
Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
INSECTICIDES
1 ARI Wasp & Hornet Killer — Wasp Freeze PT 515 12 oz $ 540
2 Conserve SC Quart $89.90
3 Dipel 2X or 4L DF 11b $12.04/1b
4 Dursban Pro 2 gal $50.64/gal
5 Enstar 2E 50z $14.00 oz
6 Gnatrol (Vectobac) 1 gal $31.51 gal
2.5 gal $28.72 gal
7 | M-PEDE 2.5 gal $19.23 gal
8 Orthene 76S, Orthene T8O $7.73/1b $12.79/can
9 Orthene PT 1300 12 oz. $12.47/0z
10 Preclude 6 0z 26.41/can
11 | Pyreth-It PT 1100 1 gal $261.00/gal
12 Talstar GC Flowable Quart $60.28/qt
Gal $236/gal




Attachment 1

Vendor Contract #0000001138

10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List

Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
13 Tame 2.4 EC Quart $199.93/qt

o




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
HERBICIDES
14 Banvel 2.5 gal $100/gal
15 Casaron 4G 501b $1.89/1b
16 Confront 1 gal $130.14
17 Corn Gluten Meal — Nutra Maze 50 1b bag $21.50
18 Crossbow 1 gal $47.13
2.5 gal $45.98
19 Devrinol S0WP 41b $10.66/1b
20 Drive 75 DF 11b $82.19/1b
21 Gallery 75 DF 11b $243.00
22 Garlon 4 2.5 gal $93.00
23 Krenite 2.5 gal $60.63/gal
24 Oust XP $48.02 $12.87/0z
25 Pathfinder 11 2.5 gal $40.43 gal
26 Rodeo 2.5 gal $52.98
27 Roundup (18% Conc) \1 gal $81.45
2.5 gal $42.83
15 gal $41.42
30 gal $40.32
28 Super Trimec 1 gal £71.92
2.5 gal $70.89




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
29 Surflan AS 2.5 gal $108.92
30 Trimec Bentgrass Formula 1 gal $29.32
2.5 gal $28.29
FUNGICIDES
31 Aliette 5.51b $24.25/1b
32 Banner Maxx 1 gal $270.00 gal
33 Bayleton 1% - Bayleton 50180 22 oz 5.95/0z
34 Blocker 10g 50 1b $1.051b
35 Chipco 26 gt 2.5 gal $131.21/gal
36 Consyst 21b $13.89/1b
37 Daconcil 5% 25 1b $1.22/1b
38 Dithane T80 — Rainshield 12 1b 3.951b
39 ° FFII 14-3-3 35.51b $92.00/bag
40 Fluid Fungicide S5 gal $121.25/gal
41 Fungicide IX 42.21b $103.05/1b
42 Fungicide VIII 22-3-5 $33.61b $74.87/1b
43 Fungicide X $52.8 $80.89/1b
44 Fungo Flo 2.5 gal $168.00/gal
45 Junction 6 lbs $8.22/1b




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Size Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
46 Medallion 8 0z $121.84/container
47 Penstar Flo 4 gal $41.79 gal
48 Prostar 70 WP 11b $51.99/1b
49 Rubigan AS 1 gal $342.44/gal




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List

Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
50 Blazon (Spray pattern indicator) 9.59 $42.48/bag
MISCELLANEOUS

51 Ammonium Phosphate 16-21-0 50 Ib bag $8.79/bag

52 List your firm’s Fertilizer Products below and in
differing container (bag) Sizes:
Pro Spring Plus 50 1b $16.50
All American Pro 50 Ib $13.38
Workhouse Gold 501b $12.28
Kwik Kick 50 1b $10.33
Protau 50 1b %1517
Gold Medal 50 1b $17.25
Five Iron 50 Ib $15.85
Long Drive 501b $17.30
Pro Summer $15.42
Six Iron $15.42
Pro Fall $ 9.92
Pro Fall Plus $12.33
Costomb $14.58
One to One $20.92
Wilgro Weed & Feed $15.75
No Phos $16.25
Mini SK $16.97
Mini N2K $17.14
Mini Eagle $22.29
Super Starter $14.92
Turf Marks $13.17
Pro Start $10.74
Pro Balance $11.24
Pro $11.91
Wi $14.17
Mini Par $17.16
Mini K $15.36
Mini Drive $22.29




Attachment 1

Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List
Item # Description Container Size | Price Per Unit
oz/lb/qt/gal
Mini M Durance $21.43
Mini Plus $21.40




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Per Unit
Size _oz/lb/qt/gal
53 Gypsum 501b $6.40
54 Calprill 50 1b $5.30
55 Doloprill 50 1b $5.33
56 Miloganite 501b $8.85
57 Turface MVP - Play Ball 50 Ib $6.50
Regular 50 1b $6.50
Fine 50 1b $6.50
WETTING AGENTS
58 Cascade Plus
Primer Select 5 $62.95
$53.62
59 Cascade Granular — Tricure 5 $59.18
30 $47.53
a5 $41.62
60 Yucca — Aquaduct 2:5 $45.22
5 $42.65
34 $39.66
61 Terra-Sorb Potassium Hydrogen
OTHER INSECTICIDES
62 Zep Tox Wasp & Hornet — Wasp Freeze 12 oz $54.00
OTHER HERBICIDES
63 Turflon Ester 19 1b $134.56
64 XL-2G 5 $1.251b




Attachment 1
Vendor Contract #0000001138
10/29/03 through 9/30/2008

Mfr’s List Price
Item # Description Container Per Unit
Size oz/lb/qt/gal

Weed & Grass Perverter 41b $1.06 1b

65 Certified 100% 3-Way Perennial Rye Grass 50 1bs $.9416
Fairway Supreme 50 Ibs $8.82

WILBUR-ELLIS ORGANIC PRODUCTS

66 Bone Meal — Ground Raw Chips — 50# Bag 3-15-0 50 Ib $12.50
67 Steamed Bone Meal 2-20-0 501b $19.82
68 Feather Meal 11-0-0 501b $15.00
69 Fish Meal 11-0-0 501b $25.10
70 Cotton Seed Meal 5-2-1 501b $10.75
71 Blood Meal  13-0-0 501b $20.72
72 Kelp Meal 50 1b $27.70
73 Alfalfa Meal 501b $9.89
74 Ground Fish Bone Meal  4-20-0 50 Ib 51553
75 Rock Phosphate 50 Ib $8.39
76 A-Maize-N (Crumble form) 9-0-0 50 1b $20.42
i Meat and Bone Meal 7-5-0 NPK 50 Ib $10.70
78 Dr. Earth Rhody, Azalea & Camillia 4-5-4 50 Ib $23.21
79 Dr. Earth Tomato, Vegetable & Herb 5-7-3 50 Ib $23.21
80 Dr. Earth Rose & Flower 5-7-2 501b $23.21
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Mf{r’s List Price

Item # Description Container Per Unit
Size oz/Ib/qt/gal

81 Dr. Earth Starter 2-4-2 50 Ib $10.70

82 Dr. All Purpose 4-4-4 50 Ib $23.21

83 Dr. Earth Fruit 7-4-2 501b $23.21

84 Dr. Earth Bud & Bloom 4-10-7 50 Ib $23.21

NOTE: You may offer any related products, include a MSDS sheet or brochure or description for
any related product you offer.

Minimum Order Amount Delivered $500.00. & $50.00 picked up by the City of Seattle

Payment Terms: Pricing firm for first year of contract

Second year 3%
Third year 3%
Fourth year 3%
Fifth year 3%

Escalation percentage for option year six through eight will be established in an agreement between
the parties not later than 30 days prior to the end of year five contract year. Failure to reach an

agreement will cause the contract to be canceled at the end of contract year five.
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